
標題: 遠東新世紀榮獲國際三項金融大獎 永續金融實力再

獲權威肯定 

 

遠東新世紀（FENC）再次在全球金融市場展現卓越實力，榮獲 Treasury 

Today《Adam Smith Awards Asia》「Best Sustainable Treasury Solution」、

FinanceAsia《Achievement Awards》「Best Sustainable Finance Deal」 及 

The Asset《Triple A Sustainable Finance Awards》「Best Sustainability 

Exchangeable Bond」 三項國際重量級獎項。這些獎項不僅彰顯遠東新世紀

在永續金融領域的領導地位與市場影響力，更展現國際權威機構對其推動綠色

轉型的高度肯定，樹立業界典範。 

 

長期以來，遠東新世紀積極運用創新金融工具，加速低碳轉型與循環經濟發

展。2024 年，公司響應政府永續金融創新政策，發行全台首檔“永續發展交

換債”（Sustainability Exchangeable Bond），透過製程優化、設備升級及能

源管理等策略，推動企業永續轉型，並致力於達成 2030 年減碳 50%、綠色

產品 50%、綠色原料 50% 的目標。本次發行亦結合亞洲水泥與遠東百貨作為

交換標的，充分發揮股權與債權整合優勢，拓展多元籌資管道。 

 

遠東新世紀連續多年獲國際權威獎項肯定，及其在資本市場創新與企業財務策

略的卓越表現，成功吸引全球資本市場關注，樹立永續金融標竿，奠定其領導

地位與市場影響力。未來，遠東新世紀將持續深化永續金融策略，結合綠色科

技創新，攜手產業夥伴推動低碳經濟，為全球永續發展貢獻更多價值。 

 
 
 

Headline: Far Eastern New Century Wins Three 

Prestigious International Finance Awards, 

Reinforcing Its Leadership in Sustainable Finance 

 
Far Eastern New Century (FENC) has once again demonstrated its 
outstanding capabilities in the global financial market by winning 
three prestigious international awards: “Best Sustainable Treasury 
Solution” at the Adam Smith Awards Asia by Treasury Today, “Best 
Sustainable Finance Deal” at the Achievement Awards by 



FinanceAsia, and “Best Sustainability Exchangeable Bond” at The 
Asset Triple A Sustainable Finance Awards. These accolades not only 
affirm FENC’s leadership and market influence in sustainable 
finance but also highlight the recognition from global institutions for 
its efforts in driving green transformation, setting a new benchmark in 
the industry. 
 
For years, FENC has actively leveraged innovative financial 
instruments to accelerate low-carbon transformation and circular 
economy development. In 2024, responding to government initiatives 
for sustainable financial innovation, FENC issued Taiwan’s first 
Sustainability Exchangeable Bond, adopting strategies such as 
process optimization, equipment upgrades, and energy management 
to advance corporate sustainability transformation. The company is 
committed to achieving a 50% reduction in carbon emissions, 50% 
green products, and 50% green raw materials by 2030. This initiative 
incorporates Asia Cement Corporation and Far Eastern Department 
Stores as exchangeable targets, fully utilizing the advantages of 
integrating equity and debt to diversify fundraising channels. 
 
FENC has consistently been awarded by prestigious international 
accolades, demonstrating excellence in capital market innovation 
and corporate financial strategy. Its achievements have successfully 
attracted global investor attention, establishing a benchmark in 
sustainable finance and reinforcing its leadership and market 
influence. Looking ahead, FENC will continue to advance its 
sustainable finance strategy, integrate green technology innovations, 
and collaborate with industry partners to drive a low-carbon 
economy, contributing to a more sustainable future worldwide. 
 
 

 


